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1. Purpose and Scope 

This Copyright Policy (“Policy”) sets out the procedures for handling allegations of copyright 
infringement in relation to content delivered via FilCDN (“we,” “us,” or “our”), a content delivery 
network and gateway built on decentralised storage solutions, including but not limited to 
Filecoin. 

We are a Cayman Islands exempted company providing software and infrastructure services. 
We do not own, control, or monitor the content stored by third-party Filecoin storage providers, 
but we respect the intellectual property rights of others and expect our users to do the same. 

2. User Responsibility 

●​ Users are solely responsible for the content they upload, store, or distribute through our 
services and network.​
 

●​ Users must ensure they have the necessary rights, licences, and permissions for all 
content they serve via our CDN and gateway.​
 

●​ We prohibit the use of our services to distribute content that infringes any third party’s 
copyright or other intellectual property rights.​
 

3. Copyright Infringement Notices 

If you believe that content delivered via our CDN infringes your copyright, you may submit a 
written notice to our designated Copyright Agent. 

Your notice must include the following information (consistent with global best practices and, 
where applicable, the U.S. Digital Millennium Copyright Act (DMCA)): 

1.​ Your full name, mailing address, telephone number, and email address.​
 

2.​ A description of the copyrighted work you claim has been infringed.​
 

3.​ The URL(s) or other identifying information to locate the allegedly infringing content.​
 



4.​ A statement that you have a good-faith belief that use of the material in the manner 
complained of is not authorised by the copyright owner, its agent, or the law.​
 

5.​ A statement, under penalty of perjury, that the information in your notice is accurate and 
that you are the copyright owner or authorised to act on behalf of the copyright owner.​
 

6.​ Your physical or electronic signature.​
 

Mailing Address: FilCDN - Space Meridian, Stuarts Corporate Services Ltd, Kensington House, 
69 Dr. Roy’s Drive George Town, Grand Cayman KY1-1104, Cayman Islands 

4. Counter-Notices 

If you believe that your content was removed or access disabled as a result of mistake or 
misidentification, you may submit a counter-notice to our Copyright Agent. 

The counter-notice must include: 

1.​ Your full name, mailing address, telephone number, and email address.​
 

2.​ Identification of the content that has been removed or disabled, and the location where it 
appeared before removal or disabling.​
 

3.​ A statement, under penalty of perjury, that you have a good-faith belief that the content 
was removed or disabled due to mistake or misidentification.​
 

4.​ A statement that you consent to the jurisdiction of:​
 

○​ The courts of the Cayman Islands, and​
 

○​ Any jurisdiction where you may be found if outside the Cayman Islands.​
 

5.​ Your physical or electronic signature. 

5. Repeat Infringer Policy 

We may suspend or terminate accounts, or block access to content, for users determined to be 
repeat infringers. A “repeat infringer” is a user who has received multiple valid infringement 
notices. 

6. No Duty to Monitor 



We do not pre-screen or actively monitor content stored with Filecoin storage providers or 
delivered via our CDN. However, we reserve the right to remove or disable access to allegedly 
infringing material upon receiving a valid notice, or if required by applicable law. 

7. Reservation of Rights 

We reserve the right to update this Policy at any time. Continued use of our services after 
updates constitutes acceptance of the revised Policy. 

8. Jurisdiction & Applicable Law 

This Policy shall be governed by and construed in accordance with the laws of the Cayman 
Islands, without regard to conflict-of-law principles. 
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